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t'sthefestiveseason.Whetheryou
embraceitornct,it'§hardtoescape
the§oundofcarol§everywhereyou
go.Forthosewhocomefromcolder
northern hemisphere clines with

traditionalwintrycelebrations,asummery
Chri§tmascantake§omeadjustingto.And
it.softena.tinewhenhomesicknessismost
acuteformigrantsastheyreflectonthesac-
rfficesandcompromisestheyhavemadr

For much of American-born Kristen
Jones'childhood,Christmaseswerewhite.
ShewaslivingwithherparentsinMichigan
intheusMidwest,savingforherfirsthome.
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whenBrett,aNewZealandpastor,cameto
stay.Sheknewimmediatelythewouldnot
bebuyingahouseinrmchigan,andtheygot
marriedwithayear.

Beforetheywed,Jonesapentsixvecksin
NewZealand.Butaftertheymamied,they
stayed in the US for another six months.
Sherecalls"cryingsolidlyforhalfanhour"
whentheyleftin2004.

"Myparentsarethreeflightsawayfroin

mehereinNewzealand.Inthestates,people
knewwhneNewzealandwas,thankstothe
LordoftheRIng§movies.Buttheystillasted
meifitwasadsvdopedcountryr'

She unndered that herself when che
noticed locals walking barefoot. But she
now rends in the slower Kiwi lifestwle,
and the less-frequent use Of processed
andinportedingredientsinNewZealand
cocking.

"We do celebrate all things festive -
Halloweel) Thanksgiwhg, and Christrm.
It'schoutabalanceofbothcultures,really.
I'manAmeri-KiwiaLtheart."
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When Jones reflects on how living in
Newzealandhaschangedher,stietouches
on how the has adapted to, and in many
way§adopted,thiscountryscomparativdy
socialist attitude in how to treat people.
Sherecognisesthisisquiteadistanceaway
fromhowchewasbrou8htup,butitsti]l
frfuright.

"Itfitsme.Asapastormyselfnow.Ican

see the need to do things differently. I'm
proud Of where I came from but I came
tothiscountrytoeddtoit,notlosenrdf
nre grown.and changed and Kivds have
impacted on my life. I don't co-ent on
Americanpolitics,as1nolongearlivethere
and1can.tseeallthedife])entsidesOfany
disussionfromhere."

HerparentswereinNeg`rZealandwhen
thefirstwaveOfCovidhit.andstryedfor
anotherfourmonths.Notknewinghowthe
pandemicwasgoingtounfoldwashardon
themall.Whenherparentsfinallyleftthe
country,shedidndhaowifchewouldever
see them again. But this year, they have
netunedtoNewzealand,recomectingand
joininginthefamftyschristmasfestivities.

Shereflects:"Whenlleftthestatesfugnd
in2004,Iwasstillsadalboutleawinganthe
peotlellovedbchind.Iprayedonthatfligiv
thatGodwouldgivemefinftyandfriends
justasprecioustomeasthoselwasleav±ng
I'dsaythatprayerhasbeenansthrerleaf

ONE-DAY WONDER
In 1997, teacher Elizabeth Barrowman
boardedaplaneinTorontoboundforAirdc-
land, and for what she saw as a working
holiday funded ty New Zealand taxpay-
ers. She didut realise that cue was frying
towardstherestofherlife.'There were very few jobs for teachers
in Camda; the didh't have a Green Card to
workintheus;andchefflttiedtoapartiou-
1aracademicpathinherhomecountry.So
she`brokefroeandNewzealandgctme".

Barrorman arfured here armmd Easter
androneduptpalocalbankinPapatoetoe
in South Auddand. "I.said, .I have money.
Ineedacar.'So,theyphonedupanhonest
cardealerandaskedhimtobringmeacar.

Thestaffsaidtome,`Hembringyouthe
rithtcar.'Andhedid.Hecametothebanlq
he sold me the car, and then proceeded to
teach me how to dri`re a stickchift car on
the twrong side' of the road. That was my
introductiontoNewzealand"

Itwasn'tallsmoothsafling."Therewere
timeswhen1thou8ht,Wow,whatthehdl
haveldene?I'donlyeverbeentothestates,
socomingona20-hourflightviaHawaiito
Newzealandwasamajorforme."

BarrcmmanisapragrmtisLwhileconing
hereallowhhertocreateherormpathcue
hasretainedhernctuerksincanada.

She met her now-husband Grant in
Augustoftheysarchearrived."1thought
hewasabitofanri9htandthen1mcthis
family.'Itwaslifebeingabsorbedintothis
massive 'hhie'." She was astonished when
cheattendedherfirstBarrow]±family
gathering,tocdchratethe85thbfithdayof
agreat-aunt,andwasourroundedtymore
thanl00pcople.

Thecouplehadtroweddingcermnonies,
soboththeirfamiliescouldcelebratewith
themlhrethou8htoflivingincanadabut
I wanted lny. children to hanne a whtion-
ship with their grandparents. I saw the
rdatiouship they had with their othel`
grandchfldrmand1masanorphan-Ihad
noparents.Thiswasmoreinportantthan
livingincarmdrr

Barrowman  deliberately prioritised

___                                         -                              __

`qiestivitiesincamda

F¥drHH:¥:„n
her children's needs over her own `Their
grandparents are wonderful. It was the
rightthingtodo."Butchenathirallymisses
ffiendsandfamilybackincanada.

At Christmas, what ma]ces her most
nostalgic  is  the  sound  Of  the  H«ro7`}
Carol written in alhout 1642 by Jesuit
missionary Jean de Brfbeuf, with its pul~
sating combination of soaring singing,
drundrcats and lyrics in the indigenous
Huron-Wendat language. Singing carols
outside in the dal`k. the ritual of cutting
down your own Christmas tree, snow and
stei8hridesarealsothingsofthepast.

'Iheseasonaldiffemeneeshamealsotaken

somegettingusedto."Ilikedtostropinthe
coldwinterweatheratchristmasincanada,
buthere,theheatisexhausting.Pestfurities
incamda.aredra:wnoutandgoonfoI.drys.
Here,itlastsadayandtheneveryoneisoff
on their holidays. I tried to do the whole
Canadian .cut the Christmas tree down
and take it ho`me to decorate' experience,
but fronkly, doing that in your Shorts in
25rdegreeheat-itjustwasn'tthesarie."

Here,§hefudsthewarmththebcachand
longsummerholidayshavepuchedherinto
creatinganderfumdngnewthditious"for

herfam±ly-ablendofcamdianandKiwi.
Thitatnigiv'when1dreanLI'malways

drivingontheri8ht-handsideoftheroad"
So,whilenowoustomsarefonged,thepast
winbustleitswayin,intrudingonthehere
andnow,saying,`Youcankidyoursdfthat
youwichanged-butattheheartofit,you're
anacanadian."

TOO HOT F=OFt TURKEY .
For Emily.Walker (not her real name),
there is no fooling herself that che isn't
English. She sounds EngistL looks it, and
hasretainedmanyofhernativecountry's
customs.Christmasisatineofverymixed
emotions.

Arrivingheremorethan20yearsago
withherthen-partner,nowhusband,she
anticipated a short stint enjoying what
this country had to offer. She had been
herebefore,solmewwhttoexpect..Iwh
decades on, the isn't too sure when the
actual agreement to stay permanently
was pledged. She found she could cope
with leaving behind a lucrative, senior
positionforanonymftyinNcwZealand,
butlcavingfamflyandfriendsintheUK
wasadifferentstory.

"Ithinkitreallyhithomewhenlhadour

firstchfld;"Walkersa:ys."1hadnofamily
support. My mother was in the UK. I was
Onmy-»

Sherealisesnowchewasprobablysuffer-
ingfrompost-nataldapression.

"1didgohackandforthtotheUKfora

number of years with the, children, but
emerytime,itwassohardtogdebackonthat
planetoret`rmtoNewzealand.Igrfevedfor
what I was leaving behind; for my friends
and family.It'skrmwingthatyoucanjustbe
withpeoplearrdtheytrulyknowwhoyou
are. There's no need to.explain anything.
Thatispricdess.inaway,Istillgrievefor
that,deapitehawingwonderfulfriendshere
inNewzealandr'

Even though Britons and Kiwis speak
thesamelanguage,theyaneverydifferent
people, the says. "Here in New Zealand,
people just seem to `gct' sport. I remember
going to a sports day event. It was an eye-
openerforme.Everyone]mewwhattodo
and everyone got inrvolved - staff, the chil-
dren and the parents. Kiwis just get stuck
in;theyhavethisamazing`gung-ho'attfude
tolife.„

Shehadamiscarriageandthenanother
childandffltutterlyalonethrouthoutthat
period."Itbrokelnyheartongrandparents'
dayatschoct.Mychildrenhadnoone.Ihad
noone...Cer,tainly.thegriefofbeingawa:y
from family has taken its toll. There is a
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persomalcost,thatisforsurer
That sense of loss is heighiened during

the festive season. She sees other friends
havingtheirextendedfamilyaroundthem
at Christmas and during other important
c>et!asit>ne.

Insteadofdoingatraditionalchristmas,
her family prefers to pack up and go to
the beach these drys. "I can't deal with the
thought Of just the few Of us around the
title,whenathomeitherewouldbeallthe
extendedfamjly.presentsandfoodr

Walkeremphasisesthatchehi8h]:yvelues
what she has here and neIver takes it for
grantedHerchildrenareREwi§andlovethe
life, she says, so che sometimes fads guflty
thatchehasasenseofgriefandlongingfor
home.

"ytiesareherenow.Thereisnopoint
trying to replicate wha:t I had before. And

really,cockingaturkyinthemiddleofthe
dayhereinNewZealand-it'snotgoingto
work, is it?

THE ``MA¢lc FORMULA"
§uzanne JeffEls also ;uggles grief carnpbc>
miseandayeamingforhomewithgrarfode
forwhatchehashere.Newzealandbecame
homeaftercheandherhuchandspentyears
mullingtheiroptiouschoutaltermtivesto
theuK.Theyfinallymovedherewithtwro
ysungdildrenin2006,`havingnevervis-
itedthecountry.

INewZealandseemedquaintandsofeto
us,andessentiafty,wediditfortheboys.
We warited them to ha:ve an outdoor life,
notacityone."

Jeffa§ was a partner in a law firm. She
knewchedich'twanttostayinthesamejob
fortherestofherlifebutwasstm"only30%
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convincedaboutthemove".Herhusband,
Stephen,wasmoreofarisk-taker,shesays,

cowhenwegothere,welivedinarental

propertyinTitinngibeforeourcontainer
amived.Theboyswenttoaruralschool.
I was choeked' that there wasn't a school
uniform.Theschoolhadapig-feedingbin,
which was an eye-opener, along with a
ftyingfroTheboysverehooked,instangr

Again,itwashdpfulstaffatalocalbank
whosuggestedtheytrylivingineastAuck-
land. The family ended up renting "an
oldbach"onthewaterfuontinBucklands
BeachWhiletheyenjoyedthe"jawrdrop-
ping'vieusandtheboys§ettledintoagcod
schcoLjeffdsfoundhersdfbadlyhissing
her career. "I experienced a dounle loss;
bothmyhomeandmycareerhadgone...I
remember,prophetically,thinldng,`Whatif
theplanesstopftying-howwhllgetback
home?„

Therea]itywasthattherestofthefinfly
werethrivingintheirnewcountry,soche
tried to figure out how the could get the
sameurandfindthehewsuzanne".

The homesidmess and feding Of toss
weredchhitating.Iastednyexpatfriends.
`Howdoyoucope?'Theywerefine.IwasmL

Intheend,someonetookmeasideandtold
methatlhadtofindmyownanswerstolny
situation,whichllaterrealisedwasgrief'

7effds did eventually find her feet. "I
startednmninginmymid-508.Idoultra-
marathons. Itre developed other st{fl] sets.
I.in much more rdred, more accepting. I
havegoalsandaLdeepsenseofachievement.
Initially,IwenttotheUKeveryyeapbut1
haven'tbeenbacksince2019."

Herbrmdr:yisinDecenha,sothistine
Of the year is doutly inportant to her. "In
theUK,Iusedtodecoratetheemtirehouse
with differently themed Chrirfuas trees
ezichirear.Itu7asalengnryealebmtionlast-
ingatleastthrowecks.Here,oncechristmas
Day is over, people pack up and go to the
beach For me in New Zealand, Christmas
isanomevent"

Although che is managing the ttvthat am
I doing heney and `twlio am I?" q`iestious,
thesenseOflossisstilltangible.Shetmows
cue has so much to be grateful for - happy
sons,abcautifL]lhome.goodjchsandamore
rdaxedvyofliving.Itisaboutleamingto
livewiththegriefofwhtmi8hthavebeen,
whnesim]1taneoustyadmowledgingthatit
isanfrostmentcheismakingforthene=rt
genemtion. I
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